o Madison-Oneida

Board of Cooperative Educational Services

Lead+Partner+Innovate~+Excel

July 14, 2022

To: Vendors for Trash and Recyclables IFB 22-06-004
RE: Bid Results

The following bid analysis sheets show the prices that were bid for Trash and
Recyclables for Madison-Oneida BOCES and its participating districts. This bid was
awarded on a category award basis as highlighted in green. Items in red have been
disqualified.

This bid was approved by the Madison-Oneida BOCES Board of Education at their
monthly meeting on July 7, 2022.

This letter does not constitute an order. Receipt of a valid school district purchase order
will be notification of an order.

Thank you for your continued support and participation in our bidding program.

Sincerely,
Vil

Madison-Oneida BOCES
Cooperative Bidding Service

4937 Spring Road ¢ P.O. Box 168 ¢ Verona, NY 13478-0168 ¢ 315.361.5500 ¢ www.moboces.org



Bids Were Received From The Following Vendors For
Trash and Recyclables Collection and Disposal IFB 22-06-004:

Bliss Environmental Services Inc.

Attention: Travis Bliss

51 Harden Blvd

PO Box 135

Camden, New York 13316

Phone: 315-245-1717

Fax: 315-245-1727

Email: info@blissenv.com

Website: www.blissenv.com

Details: Please Reference Madison-Oneida BOCES IFB 22-06-004 On Purchase Order

Syracuse Haulers Waste Removal Inc.

Attention: Rocco Grosso

6223 Thompson Road

Suite 1000

Syracuse, New York 13206

Phone: 315-426-6771

Fax: 315-426-6770

Email: kbeverime@syracusehaulers.com

Website: www.syracusehaulers.com

Details: Please Reference Madison-Oneida BOCES IFB 22-06-004 On Purchase Order

Waste Management of New York LLC

Attention: Brenda Mickol

100 Ransier Drive

West Seneca, New York 14224

Phone: 585-216-7424

Fax: 585-254-2313

Email: bmickol@wm.com

Website: www.wm.com

Details: Please Reference Madison-Oneida BOCES IFB 22-06-004 On Purchase Order



SUMMARY

Canastota Central School District
Trash and Recyclables Collection and Disposal 1IFB 22-06-004
Opens June 14, 2022 at 3:00 PM

Contract Effective July 8, 2022 through June 30, 2025

Bliss Environmental

Price Per Pickup Weekly Pick Ups Weeks Per Year Annual Total
8 yd Trash $43.00 7 52 $15,652.00
8 yd Recyclables $16.50 4 52 $3,432.00
Annual Total $19,084.00

Syracuse Haulers

Price Per Pickup Weekly Pick Ups Weeks Per Year  Annual Total
8 yd Trash $61.93 7 52 $22,542.52
8 yd Recyclables $17.93 4 52 $3,729.44
Annual Total $26,271.96

Waste Management
Price Per Pickup Weekly Pick Ups Weeks Per Year  Annual Total

8 yd Trash
8 yd Recyclables
Annual Total

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid




SUMMARY
Madison Central School District

Trash and Recyclables Collection and Disposal IFB 22-06-004

Opens June 14, 2022 at 3:00 PM

Contract Effective July 8, 2022 through June 30, 2025

Bliss Environmental

6 yd Trash
6 yd Recyclables
96 Gal Recyclables
Annual Total

Price per Pick Up Weekly Pick Ups Weeks per Year Annual Total

$45.00 2 52 $4,680.00

$16.50 1 52 $858.00

$6.00 4 52 $1,248.00
$6,786.00

Syracuse Haulers

6 yd Trash
6 yd Recyclables
96 Gal Recyclables
Annual Total

Price per Pick Up Weekly Pick Ups Weeks per Year Annual Total

$50.24 2 52 $5,224.96

$17.25 1 52 $897.00

$5.62 4 52 $1,168.96
$7,290.92

Waste Management

6 yd Trash
6 yd Recyclables
96 Gal Recyclables
Annual Total

Price per Pick Up Weekly Pick Ups Weeks per Year Annual Total
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid




SUMMARY
Morrisville-Eaton Central School District
Trash and Recyclables Collection and Disposal IFB 22-06-004
Opens June 14, 2022 at 3:00 PM
Contract Effective July 8, 2022 through June 30, 2025

Bliss Environmental

Price per Pick Up Weekly Pick Ups Weeks per Year Annual Total

8 yd Trash $55.00 5 52 $14,300.00
8 yd Recyclables $16.50 5 52 $4,290.00
Annual Total $18,590.00

Syracuse Haulers

Price per Pick Up Weekly Pick Ups Weeks per Year Annual Total

8 yd Trash $61.93 5 52 $16,101.80
8 yd Recyclables $17.93 5 52 $4,661.80
Annual Total $20,763.60

Waste Management

Price per Pick Up Weekly Pick Ups Weeks per Year Annual Total
8 yd Trash No Bid
8 yd Recyclables No Bid
Annual Total No Bid




SUMMARY

New Hartford Central School District
Trash and Recyclables Collection and Disposal IFB 22-06-004

Opens June 14, 2022 at 3:00 PM
Contract Effective July 8, 2022 through June 30, 2025

Syracue Haulers

8 Yd Trash
6 Yd Trash
8 Yd Recyclables
6 Yd Recyclables
Annual Total

Price per Pick Up Weekly Pick Ups Weeks per Year Annual Total

$44.33
$37.03
$17.93
$17.25

9

5
3
2

$20,746.44
$9,627.80
$2,797.08
$1,794.00
$34,965.32

Waste Management

8 Yd Trash
6 Yd Trash
8 Yd Recyclables
6 Yd Recyclables
Annual Total

Price per Pick Up Weekly Pick Ups Weeks per Year Annual Total

$46.12
$36.14
$51.18
$41.97

9

5
3
2

$21,584.16
$9,396.40
$7,984.08
$4,364.88
$43,329.52

Bliss Environmental

8 Yd Trash
6 Yd Trash
4Yd Trash
8 Yd Recyclables
2 Yd Recyclables
Annual Total

Price per Pick Up Weekly Pick Ups Weeks per Year Annual Total

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid




SUMMARY
Oneida City School District
Trash and Recyclables Collection and Disposal IFB 22-06-004
Opens June 14, 2022 at 3:00 PM
Contract Effective July 8, 2022 through June 30, 2025

Bliss Environmental

Price per Pick Up Weekly Pick Ups Weeks per Year Annual Total

8 Yd Trash $41.00 13 52 $27,716.00
6 Yd Trash $36.00 2 52 $3,744.00
4Yd Trash $24.00 1 52 $1,248.00
8 Yd Recyclables $16.50 6 52 $5,148.00
2 Yd Recyclables $15.00 1 52 $780.00
Annual Total $38,636.00

Syracuse Haulers

Price per Pick Up Weekly Pick Ups Weeks per Year Annual Total

8 Yd Trash $44.33 13 52 $29,967.08

6 Yd Trash $37.03 2 52 $3,851.12

4Yd Trash $29.97 1 52 $1,558.44

8 Yd Recyclables $17.93 6 52 $5,594.16
2 Yd Recyclables $16.77 1 52 $872.04

Annual Total $41,842.84

Waste Management

Price per Pick Up Weekly Pick Ups Weeks per Year Annual Total

8 Yd Trash No Bid
6 Yd Trash No Bid
4Yd Trash No Bid
8 Yd Recyclables No Bid
2 Yd Recyclables No Bid

Annual Total No Bid




SUMMARY
Rome City School District

Trash and Recyclables Collection and Disposal 1IFB 22-06-004

Opens June 14, 2022 at 3:00 PM

Contract Effective July 8, 2022 through June 30, 2025

Bliss Environmental

8 Yd Trash
8 Yd Recyclables
Annual Total

Price per Pick Up Weekly Pick Ups Weeks per Year Annual Total

$40.00 54 52 $112,320.00
$14.00 27 52 $19,656.00
$131,976.00

Syracuse Haulers

8 Yd Trash
8 Yd Recyclables
Annual Total

Price per Pick Up Weekly Pick Ups Weeks per Year Annual Total

$44.33 54 52 $124,478.64
$17.93 27 52 $25,173.72
$149,652.36

Waste Management

8 Yd Trash
8 Yd Recyclables
Annual Total

Price per Pick Up Weekly Pick Ups Weeks per Year Annual Total
No Bid
No bid
No bid




SUMMARY
Stockbridge Valley Central School District

Trash and Recyclables Collection and Disposal IFB 22-06-004

Opens June 14, 2022 at 3:00 PM

Contract Effective July 8, 2022 through June 30, 2025

Bliss Environmental

8 Yd Trash
8 Yd Recyclables
Annual Total

Price per Pick Up Weekly Pick Ups Weeks per Year Annual Total

$40.00 2 52 $4,160.00
$16.00 1 52 $832.00
$4,992.00

Syracuse Haulers

8 Yd Trash
8 Yd Recyclables
Annual Total

Price per Pick Up Weekly Pick Ups Weeks per Year Annual Total

$44.33 2 52 $4,610.32
$17.93 1 52 $932.36
$5,542.68

Waste Management

8 Yd Trash
8 Yd Recyclables
Annual Total

Price per Pick Up Weekly Pick Ups Weeks per Year Annual Total
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid




SUMMARY
Whitesboro Central School District
Trash and Recyclables Collection and Disposal 1IFB 22-06-004
Opens June 14, 2022 at 3:00 PM
Contract Effective July 8, 2022 through June 30, 2025

Bliss Environmental

Price per Pick Up Weekly Pick Ups Weeks per Year Annual Total

8 Yd Trash $37.00 16 52 $30,784.00
8 Yd Recyclables $16.50 9 52 $7,722.00
Annual Total $38,506.00

Syracuse Haulers

Price per Pick Up Weekly Pick Ups Weeks per Year Annual Total

8 Yd Trash $44.33 16 52 $36,882.56
8 Yd Recyclables $17.93 9 52 $8,391.24
Annual Total $45,273.80

Waste Management

Price per Pick Up Weekly Pick Ups Weeks per Year Annual Total
8 Yd Trash No Bid
8 Yd Recyclables No Bid
Annual Total No Bid
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