o Madison-Oneida

Board of Cooperative Educational Services

Lead+Partner+Innovate+Excel

March 11, 2024
To: Vendors for Gasoline, Diesel Fuel, Fuel Oil and Propane IFB 24-02-008
RE: Bid Results

The following bid analysis sheets show the prices that were bid for Gasoline, Diesel
Fuel, Fuel Oil and Propane for Madison-Oneida BOCES and its participating districts.
This bid was awarded on a line-by-line basis as highlighted in green. ltems in red have
been disqualified.

This bid was approved by the Madison-Oneida BOCES Board of Education at their
monthly meeting on March 7, 2024.

This letter does not constitute an order. Receipt of a valid school district purchase order
will be notification of an order.

Thank you for your continued support and participation in our bidding program.

Sincerely,

Madison-Oneida BOCES
Cooperative Bidding Service

4937 Spring Road ¢ P.O. Box 168 ¢ Verona, NY 13478-0168 ¢ 315.361.5500 ¢ www.moboces.org



Bids Were Received From the Following Vendors For
Gasoline, Diesel Fuel, Fuel Oil and Propane IFB 24-02-008:

AmeriGas Propane

Attention: Shellie Walrath

11400 NY-12

Alder Creek, NY 13301

Phone: 800-263-7442

Fax: 610-992-3259

Email: shellie.walrath@amerigas.com

Web Site: www.amerigas.com

Details: Please Reference Madison-Oneida BOCES IFB 24-02-008 on Purchase Order

Blueox Corporation

Attention: Julia Miller

38 N Canal Street

Oxford, NY 13830

Phone: 607-843-2583

Fax: 607-843-8825

Email: contactus@blueoxenergy.com

Web Site: www.blueoxenergy.com

Details: Please Reference Madison-Oneida BOCES IFB 24-02-008 on Purchase Order

Broedel Fuel Group

Attention: Jason A. Broedel

2305 St Rt 12

Hubbardsville, NY 13355

Phone: 315-691-2323

Fax: 315-691-5252

Email: Jason@broedelenergy.com

Web Site: NA

Details: Please Reference Madison-Oneida BOCES IFB 24-02-008 on Purchase Order

Buell Fuel LLC

Attention: Garth Curtis

2676 State Route 12B

Deansboro, NY 13328

Phone: 315-841-3000

Fax: 315-841-3585

Email: julia@buellfuel.com

Web site: www.buellfuel.com

Details: Please Reference Madison-Oneida BOCES IFB 24-02-008 on Purchase Order

Mirabito Holdings, Inc. dba Mirabito Energy Products

Attention: Jason Mirabito

The Metrocenter, 49 Court Street, P.O. Box 5306

Binghamton, NY 13902

Phone: 607-352-2800

Fax: 607-584-5134

Email: joe.desti@mirabito.com

Web site: www.mirabito.com

Note: Bid disqualified for proposed exceptions to terms not acceptable
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Superior Plus Propane

Attention: Thomas Tryon

5868 Success Drive

Rome, NY 13440

Phone: 315-335-6444

Fax: 315-336-5551

Email: ttryon@griffithenergy.com

Web Site: superiorpluspropane.com

Details: Please Reference Madison-Oneida BOCES IFB 24-02-008 on Purchase Order
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Camden Central School District
Regular Unleaded Gasoline IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel, Superior Plus
Propane Corporation Group LLC Propane
Albany Reseller Tank Car Average Price
as published in the Journal Of Commerce week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price $2.1251 $2.1251 $2.1251 $2.1251 $2.1251
Submit below the FLUCTUATING bid prices for Regular Unleaded
87 Octane Gasoline for the duration of the contract period
to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications
Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered by Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.1675 NO BID
(amount above commodity) $0.0424
Submit below the CONSTANT bid prices for Regular Unleaded
87 Octane Gasoline for the duration of the contract period
to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications
Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered by Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Guaranteed Quantity 50,000 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 60,000 Gallons




Holland Patent Central School District
Regular Unleaded Gasoline IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel, Superior Plus
Propane Corporation Group LLC Propane
Albany Reseller Tank Car Average Price
as published in the Journal Of Commerce week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price $2.1251 $2.1251 $2.1251 $2.1251 $2.1251
Submit below the FLUCTUATING bid prices for Regular Unleaded
87 Octane Gasoline for the duration of the contract period
to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications
Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered by Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.1966 NO BID
(amount above commodity) $0.0715
Submit below the CONSTANT bid prices for Regular Unleaded
87 Octane Gasoline for the duration of the contract period
to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications
Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered by Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Guaranteed Quantity 30,000 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 36,000 Gallons




Morrisville-Eaton Central School District
Regular Unleaded Gasoline IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel, Superior Plus
Propane Corporation Group LLC Propane
Albany Reseller Tank Car Average Price
as published in the Journal Of Commerce week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price $2.1251 $2.1251 $2.1251 $2.1251 $2.1251
Submit below the FLUCTUATING bid prices for Regular Unleaded
87 Octane Gasoline for the duration of the contract period
to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications
Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered by Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID $2.2881 $2.2051 NO BID
(amount above commodity) $0.1630 $0.0800
Submit below the CONSTANT bid prices for Regular Unleaded
87 Octane Gasoline for the duration of the contract period
to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications
Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered by Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Guaranteed Quantity 7,500 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 9,500 Gallons




Owen D Young Central School District
Regular Unleaded Gasoline IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel, Superior Plus
Propane Corporation Group LLC Propane
Albany Reseller Tank Car Average Price
as published in the Journal Of Commerce week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price $2.1251 $2.1251 $2.1251 $2.1251 $2.1251
Submit below the FLUCTUATING bid prices for Regular Unleaded
87 Octane Gasoline for the duration of the contract period
to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications
Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered by Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.2660 NO BID
(amount above commodity) $0.1409
Submit below the CONSTANT bid prices for Regular Unleaded
87 Octane Gasoline for the duration of the contract period
to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications
Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered by Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Guaranteed Quantity 2,000 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 3,000 Gallons




Oneida City School District
Regular Unleaded Gasoline IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel, Superior Plus
Propane Corporation Group LLC Propane
Albany Reseller Tank Car Average Price
as published in the Journal Of Commerce week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price $2.1251 $2.1251 $2.1251 $2.1251 $2.1251
Submit below the FLUCTUATING bid prices for Regular Unleaded
87 Octane Gasoline for the duration of the contract period
to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications
Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered by Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID $2.2821 $2.2451 NO BID
(amount above commodity) $0.1570 $0.1200
Submit below the CONSTANT bid prices for Regular Unleaded
87 Octane Gasoline for the duration of the contract period
to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications
Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered by Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Guaranteed Quantity 3,500 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 3,500 Gallons




Sauquoit Valley Central School District
Regular Unleaded Gasoline IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel, Superior Plus
Propane Corporation Group LLC Propane
Fuels Fuel Group Plus
Albany Reseller Tank Car Average Price
as published in the Journal Of Commerce week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price $2.1251 $2.1251 $2.1251 $2.1251 $2.1251
Submit below the FLUCTUATING bid prices for Regular Unleaded
87 Octane Gasoline for the duration of the contract period
to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications
Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered by Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID $2.2821 $2.2451 NO BID
(amount above commaodity) $0.1570 $0.1200
Submit below the CONSTANT bid prices for Regular Unleaded
87 Octane Gasoline for the duration of the contract period
to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications
Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered by Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Guaranteed Quantity 1,500 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 2,000 Gallons




Stockbridge Valley Central School District
Regular Unleaded Gasoline IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox

Propane Corporation

Albany Reseller Tank Car Average Price
as published in the Journal Of Commerce week of January 8, 2024

Commaodity Price $2.1251 $2.1251

Submit below the FLUCTUATING bid prices for Regular Unleaded
87 Octane Gasoline for the duration of the contract period
to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications

Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered by Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID

(amount above commaodity)

Submit below the CONSTANT bid prices for Regular Unleaded
87 Octane Gasoline for the duration of the contract period
to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications

Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered by Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID

Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel,
Group LLC
$2.1251 $2.1251
$2.2881 $2.2449
$0.1630 $0.1198
NO BID NO BID

Superior Plus
Propane

$2.1251

NO BID

NO BID

Guaranteed Quantity 15,500 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 17,000 Gallons




Vernon-Verona-Sherrill Central School District
Regular Unleaded Gasoline IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox

Propane Corporation

Albany Reseller Tank Car Average Price
as published in the Journal Of Commerce week of January 8, 2024

Commaodity Price $2.1251 $2.1251

Submit below the FLUCTUATING bid prices for Regular Unleaded
87 Octane Gasoline for the duration of the contract period
to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications

Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered by Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID

(amount above commaodity)

Submit below the CONSTANT bid prices for Regular Unleaded
87 Octane Gasoline for the duration of the contract period
to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications

Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered by Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID

Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel,

Group LLC
$2.1251 $2.1251
$2.2821 $2.2151
$0.1570 $0.0900
NO BID NO BID

Superior Plus
Propane

$2.1251

NO BID

NO BID

Guaranteed Quantity 46,000 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 46,000 Gallons




Waterville Central School District
Regular Unleaded Gasoline IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel, Superior Plus
Propane Corporation Group LLC Propane
Albany Reseller Tank Car Average Price
as published in the Journal Of Commerce week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price $2.1251 $2.1251 $2.1251 $2.1251 $2.1251
Submit below the FLUCTUATING bid prices for Regular Unleaded
87 Octane Gasoline for the duration of the contract period
to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications
Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered by Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID $2.2881 $2.2100 NO BID
(amount above commodity) $0.1630 $0.0849
Submit below the CONSTANT bid prices for Regular Unleaded
87 Octane Gasoline for the duration of the contract period
to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications
Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered by Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Guaranteed Quantity 7,500 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 7,500 Gallons




Whitesboro Central School District
Regular Unleaded Gasoline IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel, Superior Plus
Propane Corporation Group LLC Propane
Albany Reseller Tank Car Average Price
as published in the Journal Of Commerce week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price $2.1251 $2.1251 $2.1251 $2.1251 $2.1251
Submit below the FLUCTUATING bid prices for Regular Unleaded
87 Octane Gasoline for the duration of the contract period
to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications
Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered by Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID $2.2371 $2.1766 NO BID
(amount above commodity) $0.1120 $0.0515
Submit below the CONSTANT bid prices for Regular Unleaded
87 Octane Gasoline for the duration of the contract period
to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications
Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered by Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Guaranteed Quantity 50,000 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 50,000 Gallons




Camden Central School District
Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel, Superior Plus
Propane Corporation Group LLC Propane
ALBANY Reseller Tank Car Average Price as published
in the Journal of Commerce week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629

Submit below the FLUCTUATING bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.5486 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.8729 NO BID
(amount above commaodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $0.1100
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $0.1100
NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.4685 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.7928 NO BID
(amount above commaodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $0.0299
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $0.0299

Submit below the CONSTANT bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon

Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.5935 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.7455 NO BID

NET BID PRICE

Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)

Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.3530 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.7125 NO BID

Price valid until
2/27/24

Guaranteed Quantity 30,000 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 40,000 Gallons




Hamilton Central School District
Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel, Superior Plus
Propane Corporation Group LLC Propane
ALBANY Reseller Tank Car Average Price as published
in the Journal of Commerce week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629

Submit below the FLUCTUATING bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.8086 NO BID $3.5801 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $3.2329 NO BID $2.9044 NO BID
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $0.3700 $0.1415
(amount above commaodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $0.4700 $0.1415
NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.7086 NO BID $3.4815 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $3.0329 NO BID $2.8058 NO BID
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $0.2700 $0.0429
(amount above commaodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $0.2700 $0.0429

Submit below the CONSTANT bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon

Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.4600 $3.4580 $3.5175 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $2.7600 $2.8580 $2.8979 NO BID

NET BID PRICE

Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.3100 NO BID $3.3975 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $2.6100 NO BID $2.8145 NO BID
Price valid until Price valid until Price valid until
2/15/24 2/29/24 2/27/24

Guaranteed Quantity 10,000 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 18,000 Gallons




Holland Patent Central School District
Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel,  Superior Plus
Propane Corporation Group LLC Propane
ALBANY Reseller Tank Car Average Price as published
in the Journal of Commerce week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629

Submit below the FLUCTUATING bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.5786 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.9029 NO BID
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $0.1400
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $0.1400
NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.4879 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.8122 NO BID
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $0.0493
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $0.0493

Submit below the CONSTANT bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon

Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.5355 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.9215 NO BID

NET BID PRICE

Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.4200 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.8150 NO BID
Price valid until
2/27/24

Guaranteed Quantity 30,000 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 36,000 Gallons




Madison Central School District
Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel, Superior Plus
Propane Corporation Group LLC Propane
ALBANY Reseller Tank Car Average Price as published
in the Journal of Commerce week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629

Submit below the FLUCTUATING bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.8086 NO BID $3.7286 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $3.1329 NO BID $2.9879 NO BID
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $0.3700 $0.2900
(amount above commaodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $0.3700 $0.2250
NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.7086 NO BID $3.4936 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $3.0329 NO BID $2.8078 NO BID
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $0.2700 $0.0550
(amount above commaodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $0.2700 $0.0449

Submit below the CONSTANT bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon

Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.4600 NO BID $3.6130 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $2.7600 NO BID $2.8925 NO BID

NET BID PRICE

Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.3100 $3.3140 $3.3049 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $2.6100 $2.7180 $2.6989 NO BID
Price valid until Price valid until Price valid until
2/15/24 2/29/24 2/27/24

Guaranteed Quantity - 10,000 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity - 15,000 Gallons




Morrisville-Eaton Central School District
Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel, Superior Plus
Propane Corporation Group LLC Propane
ALBANY Reseller Tank Car Average Price as published
in the Journal of Commerce week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629

Submit below the FLUCTUATING bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.8086 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $3.1329 NO BID NO BID NO BID
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $0.3700
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $0.3700
NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.7086 NO BID $3.5005 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $3.0329 NO BID $2.8219 NO BID
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $0.2700 $0.0619
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $0.2700 $0.0590

Submit below the CONSTANT bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon

Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.4600 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $2.7600 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NET BID PRICE

Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.3100 $3.3480 $3.4009 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $2.6100 $2.7410 $2.7525 NO BID
Price valid until Price valid until Price valid until
2/15/24 2/29/24 2/27/24

Guaranteed Quantity 32,000 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 38,000 Gallons




Madison-Oneida BOCES
Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel, Superior Plus
Propane Corporation Group LLC Propane
ALBANY Reseller Tank Car Average Price as published
in the Journal of Commerce week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629

Submit below the FLUCTUATING bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.8086 NO BID $3.7886 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $3.1329 NO BID $3.0529 NO BID
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $0.3700 $0.3500
(amount above commaodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $0.3700 $0.2900
NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.7086 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $3.0329 NO BID NO BID NO BID
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $0.2700
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $0.2700

Submit below the CONSTANT bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon

Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.4600 $3.4160 $3.6355 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $2.7600 $2.8140 $3.0275 NO BID

NET BID PRICE

Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.3100 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $2.6100 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Price valid until Price valid until Price valid until
2/15/24 2/29/24 2/27/24

Guaranteed Quantity 5,000 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 7,500 Gallons




Owen D Young Central School District
Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel,  Superior Plus
Propane Corporation Group LLC Propane
ALBANY Reseller Tank Car Average Price as published
in the Journal of Commerce week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629

Submit below the FLUCTUATING bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.7986 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.1229 NO BID
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $0.3600
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $0.3600
NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.5486 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.8729 NO BID
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $0.1100
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $0.1100

Submit below the CONSTANT bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon

Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.7155 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.0915 NO BID

NET BID PRICE

Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.4810 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.7995 NO BID
Price valid until
2/27/24

Guaranteed Quantity 11,000 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 11,900 Gallons




Oneida City School District
Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel, Superior Plus
Propane Corporation Group LLC Propane
ALBANY Reseller Tank Car Average Price as published
in the Journal of Commerce week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629

Submit below the FLUCTUATING bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.8086 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $3.1329 NO BID NO BID NO BID
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $0.3700
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $0.3700
NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.7086 NO BID $3.5225 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $3.0329 NO BID $2.8468 NO BID
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $0.2700 $0.0839
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $0.2700 $0.0839

Submit below the CONSTANT bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon

Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.4600 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $2.7600 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NET BID PRICE

Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.3100 $3.3140 $3.4255 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $2.6100 $2.7180 $2.7075 NO BID
Price valid until Price valid until Price valid until
2/15/24 2/29/24 2/27/24

Guaranteed Quantity 49,000 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 60,000 Gallons




Sauquoit Valley Central School District
Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel, Superior Plus
Propane Corporation Group LLC Propane
ALBANY Reseller Tank Car Average Price as published
in the Journal of Commerce week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629

Submit below the FLUCTUATING bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.8086 NO BID $3.7294 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $3.1329 NO BID $3.0537 NO BID
(amount above commaodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $0.3700 $0.2908
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $0.3700 $0.2908
NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.7086 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $3.0329 NO BID NO BID NO BID
(amount above commaodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $0.2700
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $0.2700

Submit below the CONSTANT bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon

Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.4600 $3.4380 $3.8511 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $2.7600 $2.8350 $2.9175 NO BID

NET BID PRICE

Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.3100 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $2.6100 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Price valid until Price valid until Price valid until
2/15/24 2/29/24 2/27/24

Guaranteed Quantity 20,000 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 25,000 Gallons




Stockbridge Valley Central School District
Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel, Superior Plus
Propane Corporation Group LLC Propane
ALBANY Reseller Tank Car Average Price as published
in the Journal of Commerce week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629

Submit below the FLUCTUATING bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.8086 NO BID $3.7886 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $3.1329 NO BID $3.1129 NO BID
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $0.3700 $0.3500
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $0.3700 $0.3500
NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.7086 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $3.0329 NO BID NO BID NO BID
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $0.2700
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $0.2700

Submit below the CONSTANT bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon

Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.4600 $3.4580 $3.7005 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $2.7600 $2.8580 $2.9095 NO BID

NET BID PRICE

Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.3100 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $2.6100 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Price valid until Price valid until Price valid until
2/15/24 2/29/24 2/27/24

Guaranteed Quantity 5,000 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 6,000 Gallons




Vernon-Verona-Sherrill Central School District
Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel, Superior Plus
Propane Corporation Group LLC Propane
ALBANY Reseller Tank Car Average Price as published
in the Journal of Commerce week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629

Submit below the FLUCTUATING bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.5956 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.8019 NO BID
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $0.1570
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $0.0390

Submit below the CONSTANT bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon

Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NET BID PRICE

Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID NO BID $3.3140 $3.4555 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID NO BID $2.7180 $2.7629 NO BID
Price valid until Price valid until
2/29/24 2/27/24

I Guaranteed Quantity 51,000 Gallons (45,000 Diesel/ 6,000 Kerosene), Total Estimated Quantity 51,000 (45,000 Diesel/ 6,000 Kerosene) I




Waterville Central School District
Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel, Superior Plus
Propane Corporation Group LLC Propane
ALBANY Reseller Tank Car Average Price as published
in the Journal of Commerce week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629

Submit below the FLUCTUATING bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.8086 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $3.1329 NO BID NO BID NO BID
(amount above commaodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $0.3700
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $0.3700
NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.7086 NO BID $3.5136 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $3.0329 NO BID $2.8175 NO BID
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $0.2700 $0.0750
(amount above commaodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $0.2700 $0.0546

Submit below the CONSTANT bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon

Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.4600 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $2.7600 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NET BID PRICE

Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID $3.3100 $3.3140 $3.4693 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID $2.6100 $2.7180 $2.7495 NO BID
Price valid until Price valid until Price valid until
2/15/24 2/29/24 2/27/24

Guaranteed Quantity 25,000 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 30,000 Gallons




Whitesboro Central School District
Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel, Superior Plus
Propane Corporation Group LLC Propane
ALBANY Reseller Tank Car Average Price as published
in the Journal of Commerce week of January 8, 2024
Commaodity Price
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386 $3.4386
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629 $2.7629

Submit below the FLUCTUATING bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.4936 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.8125 NO BID
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) $0.0550
(amount above commodity - Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) $0.0496

Submit below the CONSTANT bid prices for ULTRA LOW DIESEL #1 (KEROSENE) and ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 for the duration
of the contract period to be supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications.

NET BID PRICE
Delivered By Tank Wagon

Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NET BID PRICE

Delivered By Motor Transport (Min 5,500 Gal)
Diesel #1 (Ultra Low Sulfur Kerosene) NO BID NO BID $3.3040 $3.3715 NO BID
Diesel #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel) NO BID NO BID $2.7020 $2.7015 NO BID
Price valid until Price valid until
2/29/24 2/27/24

Guaranteed Quantity 70,000 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 70,000 Gallons




Camden Central School District
Ultra Low Sulfur Fuel Oil IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel,
Propane Corporation Group LLC
Albany Reseller Tank Car Average Price
as published in the Journal Of Commerce
week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price $2.6802 $2.6802 $2.6802 $2.6802

Submit below your FLUCTUATING bid prices for ULTRA LOW SULFUR #2 FUEL OIL for the duration of the contract period to be
supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications

Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered By Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.8852
(amount above commodity - Fuel Oil Delivered by Tank Wagon) $0.2050
Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered By Motor Transport NO BID $2.8300 NO BID $2.7402
(amount above commodity - Fuel Oil Delivered by Motor Transport) $0.1498 $0.0600

Submit below your CONSTANT bid prices for ULTRA LOW SULFUR #2 FUEL OIL for the duration of the contract period to be
supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications

Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered By Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.0095
Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered By Motor Transport NO BID $2.7490 NO BID $2.6595
Price valid until Price valid until
2/15/24 2/27/24

Superior Plus
Propane

$2.6802

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Guaranteed C-Iuantity - 106,500 Gallons, Total Estimated ﬁuantity - 137,500 Gallons




Hamilton Central School District
Ultra Low Sulfur Fuel Oil IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel,
Propane Corporation Group LLC
Albany Reseller Tank Car Average Price
as published in the Journal Of Commerce
week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price $2.6802 $2.6802 $2.6802 $2.6802

Submit below your FLUCTUATING bid prices for ULTRA LOW SULFUR #2 FUEL OIL for the duration of the contract period to be
supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications

Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered By Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(amount above commodity)

Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered By Motor Transport NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.7895

(amount above commaodity) $0.1093

Submit below your CONSTANT bid prices for ULTRA LOW SULFUR #2 FUEL OIL for the duration of the contract period to be
supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications

Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered By Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered By Motor Transport NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.7695

Price valid until

2/27/24

Superior Plus
Propane

$2.6802

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Guaranteed (-)uantity -0 (-Eallons, Total Estimated ﬁuantity -10,000 Gallons




Madison Central School District
Ultra Low Sulfur Fuel Oil IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel,
Propane Corporation Group LLC
Albany Reseller Tank Car Average Price
as published in the Journal Of Commerce
week of January 8, 2023
Commodity Price $2.6802 $2.6802 $2.6802 $2.6802

Submit below your FLUCTUATING bid prices for ULTRA LOW SULFUR #2 FUEL OIL for the duration of the contract period to be
supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications

Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered By Tank Wagon NO BID $3.0900 NO BID $3.0415
(amount above commodity) $0.4098 $0.3613
Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered By Motor Transport NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

(amount above commaodity)

Submit below your CONSTANT bid prices for ULTRA LOW SULFUR #2 FUEL OIL for the duration of the contract period to be
supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications

Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered By Tank Wagon NO BID $2.9990 $2.7980 $3.1115

Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered By Motor Transport NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Price valid until Price valid until Price valid until

2/15/24 2/29/24 2/27/24

Superior Plus
Propane

$2.6802

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Guaranteed Quantity 1,500 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 2,000 Gallons




Morrisville-Eaton Central School District
Ultra Low Sulfur Fuel Oil IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel,
Propane Corporation Group LLC
Albany Reseller Tank Car Average Price
as published in the Journal Of Commerce
week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price $2.6802 $2.6802 $2.6802 $2.6802

Submit below your FLUCTUATING bid prices for ULTRA LOW SULFUR #2 FUEL OIL for the duration of the contract period to be
supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications

Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered By Tank Wagon NO BID $3.0900 NO BID $3.0415
(amount above commodity) $0.4098 $0.3613
Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered By Motor Transport NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

(amount above commaodity)

Submit below your CONSTANT bid prices for ULTRA LOW SULFUR #2 FUEL OIL for the duration of the contract period to be
supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications

Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered By Tank Wagon NO BID $2.9990 $2.8060 $3.0115

Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered By Motor Transport NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Price valid until Price valid until Price valid until

2/15/24 2/29/24 2/27/24

Superior Plus
Propane

$2.6802

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Guaranteed Quantity 1,800 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 2,000 Gallons




Owen D Young Central School District
Ultra Low Sulfur Fuel Oil Fuel IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel,
Propane Corporation Group LLC
Albany Reseller Tank Car Average Price
as published in the Journal Of Commerce
week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price $2.6802 $2.6802 $2.6802 $2.6802

Submit below your FLUCTUATING bid prices for ULTRA LOW SULFUR #2 FUEL OIL for the duration of the contract period to be
supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications

Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered By Tank Wagon NO BID $3.0990 NO BID $2.9902
(amount above commodity) $0.4188 $0.3100

Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered By Motor Transport NO BID $2.9490 NO BID $2.7927
(amount above commodity) $0.2688 $0.1125

Submit below your CONSTANT bid prices for ULTRA LOW SULFUR #2 FUEL OIL for the duration of the contract period to be
supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications

Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered By Tank Wagon NO BID $2.8990 NO BID $2.9995
Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered By Motor Transport NO BID $2.7990 NO BID $2.7425
Price valid until Price valid until
2/15/24 2/27/24

Superior Plus
Propane

$2.6802

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Guaranteed ﬁuantity 23,000 (-Eallons, Total Estimated ﬁuantity 30,500 Gallons




Oneida City School District
Ultra Low Sulfur Fuel Oil IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel,
Propane Corporation Group LLC
Albany Reseller Tank Car Average Price
as published in the Journal Of Commerce
week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price $2.6802 $2.6802 $2.6802 $2.6802

Submit below your FLUCTUATING bid prices for ULTRA LOW SULFUR #2 FUEL OIL for the duration of the contract period to be
supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications

Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered By Tank Wagon NO BID $3.0990 NO BID $2.9702

(amount above commodity) $0.4188 $0.2900

Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered By Motor Transport NO BID $2.9490 NO BID NO BID
(amount above commaodity) $0.2688

Submit below your CONSTANT bid prices for ULTRA LOW SULFUR #2 FUEL OIL for the duration of the contract period to be
supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications

Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered By Tank Wagon NO BID $2.8990 $2.8180 $2.9525

Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered By Motor Transport NO BID $2.7990 NO BID NO BID

Price valid until Price valid until Price valid until

2/15/24 2/29/24 2/27/24

Superior Plus
Propane

$2.6802

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Guaranteed ﬁuantity 10,500 Gallons, Total Estimated ﬁuantity 15,000 Gallons




Sauquoit Valley Central School District
Ultra Low Sulfur Fuel Oil IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel,
Propane Corporation Group LLC
Albany Reseller Tank Car Average Price
as published in the Journal Of Commerce
week of January 8, 2024
Commodity Price $2.6802 $2.6802 $2.6802 $2.6802

Submit below your FLUCTUATING bid prices for ULTRA LOW SULFUR #2 FUEL OIL for the duration of the contract period to be
supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications

Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered By Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.6802
(amount above commodity) $1.0000
Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered By Motor Transport NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

(amount above commaodity)

Submit below your CONSTANT bid prices for ULTRA LOW SULFUR #2 FUEL OIL for the duration of the contract period to be
supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications

Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered By Tank Wagon NO BID NO BID $2.8490 $3.5925

Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered By Motor Transport NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Price valid until Price valid until

2/29/24 2/27/24

Superior Plus
Propane

$2.6802

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Guaranteed Quantity 200 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 250 Gallons




Madison Central School District
Propane IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel
Propane Corporation Group
Selkirk Principal Average Price
as published in the BPN Weekly Propane Newsletter on
January 4, 2024
Commodity Price $1.0199 $1.0199 $1.0199

Submit below your FLUCTUATING bid prices for PROPANE for the duration of the contract period to be
supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications

Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered By Tank Wagon $1.2699 $1.5990 NO BID

(amount above commaodity)

Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered By Motor Transport NO BID $1.2490 NO BID

(amount above commodity)

Submit below your CONSTANT bid prices for PROPANE for the duration of the contract period to be
supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications

Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered By Tank Wagon $1.4400 $1.7600 $1.4710

Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered By Motor Transport NO BID $1.4990 NO BID

Buell Fuel,
LLC

$1.0199

$1.1699
$0.1500

$1.1699
$0.1500

$1.4190

$1.4190

Superior Plus
Propane

$1.0199

$1.2699

NO BID

$1.4400

NO BID

Price valid until

Price valid until Price valid until Price valid until Price valid until 2/14/24 (by end

2/16/24 2/15/24 2/29/24

2/27/24

of business
day)

Guaranteed Quantity 60,000 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 65,000 Gallons




Morrisville-Eaton Central School District
Propane IFB 24-02-008
Opened February 6, 2024 at 3:00 PM

AmeriGas Blueox Broedel Fuel Buell Fuel, Superior Plus
Propane Corporation Group LLC Propane
Selkirk Principal Average Price
as published in the BPN Weekly Propane Newsletter on
January 4, 2024
Commodity Price $1.0199 $1.0199 $1.0199 $1.0199 $1.0199

Submit below your FLUCTUATING bid prices for PROPANE for the duration of the contract period to be
supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications

Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered By Tank Wagon $1.2399 $1.5990 NO BID $1.1499 $1.2399
(amount above commodity) $0.2200 $0.5791 $0.1300 $0.2200

Net Bid Price - Fluctuating Delivered By Motor Transport $1.2399 $1.2490 NO BID $1.1499 $1.2399
(amount above commaodity) $0.2200 $0.2291 $0.1300 $0.2200

Submit below your CONSTANT bid prices for PROPANE for the duration of the contract period to be
supplied in compliance with the foregoing specifications

Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered By Tank Wagon $1.4100 $1.7600 NO BID $1.3250 $1.4100

Net Bid Price - Constant Delivered By Motor Transport $1.4100 $1.4990 $1.3220 $1.3250 $1.4100
Price valid until
Price valid until Price valid until Price valid until Price valid until 2/14/24 (by end
2/16/24 2/15/24 2/29/24 2/27/24 of business
day)

Guaranteed Quantity 61,000 Gallons, Total Estimated Quantity 70,000 Gallons
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